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Coventry C|ty Council Information Governance Team

Postal Address:
Coventry City Council
PO Box 15

Council House
Coventry

CV1 5RR

www.coventry.gov.uk

E-mail: infogov@coventry.gov.uk
Phone: 024 7697 5408

25 November 2021

Dear Sir/Madam

Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA)
Request ID: FOI374009779

Thank you for your request for information relating to Christmas Market parking.
You have requested the following information:

1. How many roads do you close during the Christmas market taking place in your
city/town? Please list roads and miles of roads closed, broken down by year for 2019, 2020,
and plans for 2021. If possible, please also provide for 2017 and 2018.

We can confirm that there were no closures for a Christmas market for these years.

2. How many parking fines were issued within the town centre whilst the Christmas market
was open? And how much did these parking fines equate too? Please provide the data
broken down by year for 2018, 2019 and 2020.

Please see the attached document.

3. Do you accommodate any additional parking spaces during the Christmas market
period? If so, how many and how far away are these from the Christmas market? (miles) If
this number has increased per annum please provide a breakdown by year for 2019, 2020
and plans for 2021. If possible, please also provide for 2017 and 2018.

No, the Council does not accommodate any additional parking spaces during the Christmas market
period.



4. Does the town/city see an increase in revenue from parking during the Christmas market
period? If so, please provide a breakdown by year for 2018, 2019 and 2020.

Please see the attached document.

5. How many complaints have you received regarding the safety of motor vehicles during
the Christmas market period? Please provide a breakdown by year for 2018, 2019 and 2020.

We can confirm that we do not hold this information and are advising you as per Section 1(1) of the
Act. We do not record or hold this information.

The supply of information in response to a FOI/EIR request does not confer an automatic right to
re-use the information. You can use any information supplied for the purposes of private study and
non-commercial research without requiring further permission. Similarly, information supplied can
also be re-used for the purposes of news reporting. An exception to this is photographs. Please
contact us if you wish to use the information for any other purpose.

For information, we publish a variety of information such as: FOI/EIR Disclosure Log, Publication
Scheme, Facts about Coventry and Open Data that you may find of useful if you are looking for
information in the future.

If you are unhappy with the handling of your request, you can ask us to review our response.
Requests for reviews should be submitted within 40 days of the date of receipt of our response to
your original request — email: infogov@coventry.gov.uk

If you are unhappy with the outcome of our review, you can write to the Information Commissioner,
who can be contacted at: Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane,
Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF or email icocasework@ico.org.uk.

Please remember to quote the reference number above in your response.

Yours faithfully

Information Governance
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City Centre Location
Barracks Circulatory Road
Barracks Multi-Storey Cp
Bayley Lane

Bishop Street

Bishop Street Cp

Bond Street

Broadgate

Broadway

Burges

Chapel Street

Chauntry Place
Cheylesmore
Cheylesmore Cp

Church Street

City Arcade Car Park
Cook Street

Coop Service Area

Cope Street

Corporation Street

Cox Street

Cox Street Cp

Croft Road

Cross Cheaping

Cuckoo Lane

Earl Street

Fairfax Street

Fleet Street

Friars Road

Gosford Street

Gosford Street Cp
Greyfriars Lane
Greyfriars Road

Grove Street

Grove Street Cp

Hales Street

Hay Lane

High Street

Hill Street

Hill Top

Ironmonger Row

Jordan Well

Lamb Street

Little Park Street

Lower Holyhead Road
Manor House Cp

Manor House Drive
Moat Street Cp

Much Park Street

New Buildings

New Union St Multi-Storey Cp
New Union Street

New Union Street Service Area
Palmer Lane

Pepper Lane

Pepper Lane Service Area
Priory Row

Priory Street

Priory Street North
Queen Victoria Road
Retail Market (Circ Road)
Salt Lane

Serv Rd To Rear Belgrade Thtre
Service Road To Rear Belgrade Theatre
Service Road To Rear Belgrade Theatre
Sheriffs Orchard

Silver Street

Spon Street

Spon Street Car Park
Spon Street Cp

Spon Street Car Park

St John's Street

2018

2019

2119 £119,340.00 £62,572.22 2641 £144,226.00 £69,889.98
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£6,555.00
£2,382.00
£315.00
£1,344.00
£1,931.00
£0.00
£70.00
£0.00
£401.00
£140.00
£35.00
£2,487.00
£218.00
£70.00
£776.00
£105.00
£950.00
£533.00
£1,004.00
£965.00
£2,141.00
£70.00
£638.00
£1,871.00
£70.00
£200.00
£1,403.00
£1,392.00
£2,741.00
£2,956.00
£210.00
£633.00
£854.00
£150.00
£864.00
£1,674.00
£4,261.00
£130.00
£350.00
£0.00
£70.00
£363.00
£5,894.00
£2,126.00
£443.00
£288.00
£375.00
£3,604.00
£3,747.00
£125.00
£301.00
£245.00
£70.00
£9,219.00
£2,194.00
£210.00
£0.00
£175.00
£1,582.00
£2,573.00
£183.00
£759.00
£0.00

759
£1,030.00
£4,499.00
£5,687.00
£1,358.00
£0.00
1358
£0.00

Payments
£2,935.00
£733.00
£245.00
£928.00
£991.00
£0.00
£70.00
£0.00
£226.00
£140.00
£35.00
£1,402.00
£110.00
£0.00
£531.45
£35.00
£611.00
£210.00
£708.00
£576.00
£1,200.00
£70.00
£315.00
£848.00
£70.00
£95.00
£870.00
£951.00
£1,245.00
£1,731.00
£175.00
£150.00
£336.00
£125.00
£409.62
£819.38
£1,852.00
£105.00
£385.00
£0.00
£0.00
£213.00
£3,386.77
£1,415.00
£245.00
£218.00
£150.00
£2,459.00
£2,165.00
£75.00
£75.00
£210.00
£35.00
£4,317.00
£1,354.00
£210.00
£0.00
£50.00
£823.00
£1,214.00
£183.00
£385.00
£0.00
385
£220.00
£988.00
£3,809.00
£833.00
£0.00
833
£0.00

PCNs PCN Charge

20
90
45
87
66
3
8
5
23

= O 00 W N

14
10
11
13
32
19
38

28
27

59

37

66

10
86
11
35
79
30
20

15
148
97

51
84

17
14
109
38
11
10
27
17
18
18
140
130
44

44

£1,187.00
£5,859.00
£2,256.00
£5,155.00
£3,097.00
£210.00
£533.00
£210.00
£1,362.00
£138.00
£175.00
£527.00
£233.00
£3.00
£573.00
£455.00
£603.00
£945.00
£2,008.00
£765.00
£1,391.00
£105.00
£1,580.00
£1,728.00
£35.00
£3,521.00
£148.00
£1,653.00
£469.00
£2,534.00
£323.00
£396.00
£430.00
£2,912.00
£646.00
£2,132.00
£5,366.00
£1,461.00
£1,437.00
£148.00
£280.00
£838.00
£7,295.00
£4,564.00
£140.00
£315.00
£225.00
£2,441.00
£4,708.00
£60.00
£702.00
£35.00
£778.00
£7,469.00
£2,904.00
£245.00
£716.00
£388.00
£1,281.00
£1,066.00
£323.00
£1,292.00
£0.00
1292
£525.00
£9,991.00
£6,415.00
£1,842.00
£0.00
1842
£0.00

Payments
£576.00
£1,619.00
£1,505.00
£2,233.00
£1,533.00
£140.00
£315.00
£210.00
£428.00
£25.00
£105.00
£110.00
£150.00
£35.00
£430.00
£350.00
£245.00
£595.00
£1,093.00
£515.00
£825.00
£105.00
£568.00
£455.00
£35.00
£2,201.00
£35.00
£928.00
£225.00
£1,276.00
£288.00
£200.00
£360.00
£2,019.00
£350.00
£630.00
£1,478.00
£793.00
£315.00
£0.00
£175.00
£655.00
£3,965.00
£3,076.00
£105.00
£175.00
£225.00
£1,189.00
£2,523.00
£60.00
£333.00
£35.00
£525.00
£2,541.72
£813.00
£245.00
£210.00
£280.00
£858.00
£568.00
£218.00
£821.00
£0.00
821
£155.00
£1,849.20
£3,961.35
£1,136.00
£0.00
1136
£0.00

2020

664 £36,908.00 £16,071.57
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£323.00
£1,776.00
£350.00
£208.00
£608.00
£0.00
£0.00
£0.00
£0.00
£50.00
£70.00
£0.00
£275.00
£0.00
£83.00
£0.00
£1,456.00
£70.00
£280.00
£85.00
£0.00
£0.00
£0.00
£105.00
£70.00
£1,381.00
£0.00
£631.00
£95.00
£693.00
£592.00
£25.00
£60.00
£635.00
£105.00
£487.00
£0.00
£576.00
£409.00
£0.00
£0.00
£120.00
£7,310.00
£838.00
£0.00
£35.00
£0.00
£1,246.00
£175.00
£0.00
£359.00
£35.00
£0.00
£35.00
£70.00
£0.00
£148.00
£0.00
£594.00
£1,316.00
£705.00
£0.00
£350.00
350
£178.00
£2,289.00
£766.00
£0.00
£656.00
656
£1,087.00

Payments
£105.00
£675.00
£350.00

£75.00
£403.00
£0.00
£0.00
£0.00
£0.00
£50.00
£70.00
£0.00
£175.00
£0.00
£0.00
£0.00
£595.00
£70.00
£105.00
£85.00
£0.00
£0.00
£0.00
£35.00
£0.00
£840.00
£0.00
£295.00
£35.00
£410.00
£105.00
£0.00
£60.00
£400.00
£35.00
£0.00
£0.00
£355.00
£78.12
£0.00
£0.00
£0.00
£2,738.75
£185.00
£0.00
£35.00
£0.00
£461.00
£175.00
£0.00
£85.00
£35.00
£0.00
£0.00
£70.00
£0.00
£35.00
£0.00
£278.00
£418.16
£70.00
£0.00
£140.00
140
£95.00
£944.00
£521.00
£0.00
£453.00
453
£519.00
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St Johns Street

St John's Street

St Mary Street

St Patricks Road

Starley Road

Tower Street

Tower Street

Tower Street

Townsend Road

Trinity Church Yard

Trinity Street

Upper Well Street
Warwick Lane

Warwick Road

Watch Close

Watch Close Car Park
West Orchard Service Area
West Orchards

West Orchards Service Area
West Orchards Service Area
Whitefriars Cp

Whitefriars Lane
Whitefriars Street
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25
56
62
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49
0
11
2
1
31

£1,020.00
1020
£4,135.00
£366.00
£70.00
£0.00
£280.00
280
£105.00
£35.00
£8,497.00
£1,056.00
£3,532.00
£3,946.00
£260.00
£350.00
£802.00
£3,351.00
£0.00

802
£100.00
£35.00
£1,391.00

£685.00
685
£2,962.00
£366.00
£35.00
£0.00
£280.00
280
£35.00
£35.00
£3,536.00
£735.00
£1,670.00
£1,781.00
£190.00
£210.00
£175.00
£1,650.00
£0.00

175
£50.00
£0.00
£906.00
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£1,187.00
1187
£3,311.00
£35.00
£253.00
£0.00
£0.00

0

£0.00
£0.00
£8,600.00
£1,921.00
£4,363.00
£3,741.00
£505.00
£280.00
£646.00
£2,210.00
£0.00

646
£2,920.00
£0.00
£2,707.00

£756.00
756
£1,778.74
£35.00
£35.00
£0.00
£0.00

0

£0.00
£0.00
£4,049.00
£1,175.09
£2,039.80
£1,855.00
£365.00
£105.00
£345.86
£1,344.22
£0.00
345.86
£2,052.00
£0.00
£1,959.00
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1087
£1,682.00
£0.00
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70
£0.00
£0.00
£245.00
£25.00
£776.00
£463.00
£0.00
£0.00
£0.00
£2,172.00
£506.00
506
£0.00
£120.00
£969.00

£0.00
519
£877.54
£0.00
£70.00
£0.00
£0.00

0

£0.00
£0.00
£140.00
£25.00
£370.00
£153.00
£0.00
£0.00
£0.00
£934.00
£70.00
70
£0.00
£50.00
£718.00



