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E-mail: infogov@coventry.gov.uk 
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20 December 2023 

Dear Sir/Madam 

Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA) 
Request ID: FOI565871527 

Thank you for your request for information relating to Children's Services employee demographics.

You have requested the following information:

1. Anonymised demographics of all staff currently employed in the following teams within
children's services – special educational needs, inclusion, education improvement, virtual
school and educational psychology (not exhaustive if LA has a different set up within its
education teams) – please provide ages, gender and length of service of the employees 

In response to Question 1, we refer you to the attached tables. Please note the figures provided
are based on hierarchy for Education and Skills. 

2. Retention rates for all staff with management / leadership responsibility in the above
teams. How long have the post holders been in their posts and how many times has the
post been recruited to in the last 5 years. 

In response to Question 2, we refer you to the attached document for the length of service. With
regards to the retention rates, we confirm we do not hold this information and are informing you as
per Section 1(1) of the Act. We do not have a way of identifying this information for you. 

However, to assist, based on the overall ‘Senior Grade’ category, we confirm there have been no
leavers from that cohort of employees. Therefore, the current turnover is nil. 

3. Any existing data or anonymised reports from exit reviews conducted with any staff



leaving the teams mentioned above. If it not possible to provide anonymised copies, please
provide a list of the reasons of all employees from exit interviews for the last 2 years. 

In response to Question 3, we confirm we do not hold this information and are informing you as per
Section 1(1) of the Act. We do not record data on exit interviews on our system. However, to
assist, we can provide a breakdown of the leave reasons for employees who left from Education
and Skills for the period January 2022 to December 2023. See the attached document for details. 

4. Information relating to professional development programmes offered to employees
within children's services. 

All newly qualified social workers complete a 4-week induction that features mandatory training and
a variety of workshops to support with the transition from university into the workplace. In addition,
they complete a 12-month programme and the first 6 months of the programme will be with the
Academy, with plans to complete the latter 6 months in their host team. This features a 26-week
offer of workshops and training in the morning and signs of safety group supervision in the
afternoon. Later in the day, they are given the opportunity to complete their portfolio work. 

For further details on the program, please refer to the below link: 

https://www.coventry.gov.uk/future-talent/social-work-academy-3 

5. Data / Results of any leadership questionnaires you have asked employees within
children's services to complete within the last 2 years including workforce satisfaction
surveys. 

In response to Question 5, we confirm we do not hold this information and are informing you as per
Section 1(1) of the Act. We do not record this information on our system. 

6. Details and / copies of any current staff retention policies / initiatives 

Please see the attached document titled Market Supplement Policy. 

The supply of information in response to a FOI/EIR request does not confer an automatic right to
re-use the information. You can use any information supplied for the purposes of private study and
non-commercial research without requiring further permission. Similarly, information supplied can
also be re-used for the purposes of news reporting. An exception to this is photographs. Please
contact us if you wish to use the information for any other purpose. 

For information, we publish a variety of information such as:  FOI/EIR Disclosure Log,  Publication
Scheme,  Facts about Coventry and   Open Data that you may find of useful if you are looking for
information in the future. 

If you are unhappy with the handling of your request, you can ask us to review our response.
Requests for reviews should be submitted within 40 days of the date of receipt of our response to
your original request – email:  infogov@coventry.gov.uk

If you are unhappy with the outcome of our review, you can write to the Information Commissioner,
who can be contacted at: Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane,
Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF or email  icocasework@ico.org.uk.



Please remember to quote the reference number above in your response.

Yours faithfully 
  

Information Governance 






























