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Coventry City Council
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Coventry
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www.coventry.gov.uk

E-mail: infogov@coventry.gov.uk
Phone: 024 7697 5408

05 March 2024
Dear Sir/Madam

Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA)
Request ID: FOI580368451

Thank you for your request for information relating to Planning Appeals.
You have requested the following information:

1. I would like to request the amount of money spent deciding on planning appeals in this
local authority from the beginning of 2010 to the present day, or as recent as the data goes.
This should be in a yearly format.

We confirm that we do not hold this information and are advising you as per Section 1(1) of the
Act. We do not hold that information as part of the planning record.

2. 1 would also like data on what percentage of planning decisions went to appeal, AND
what percentage of appeals were successful. This should be in a yearly format.

We can provide data from 2011 onwards which is contained in the attached report. To assist, we
advise that we will be shortly implementing improved reporting tools which will allow us to extract
data going back to 2010. This information may be requested after April as new FOI request.

The supply of information in response to a FOI/EIR request does not confer an automatic right to
re-use the information. You can use any information supplied for the purposes of private study and
non-commercial research without requiring further permission. Similarly, information supplied can
also be re-used for the purposes of news reporting. An exception to this is photographs. Please
contact us if you wish to use the information for any other purpose.



For information, we publish a variety of information such as: FOI/EIR Disclosure Log, Publication
Scheme, Facts about Coventry and Open Data that you may find of useful if you are looking for
information in the future.

If you are unhappy with the handling of your request, you can ask us to review our response.
Requests for reviews should be submitted within 40 days of the date of receipt of our response to
your original request — email: infogov@coventry.gov.uk

If you are unhappy with the outcome of our review, you can write to the Information Commissioner,
who can be contacted at: Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane,
Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF or email icocasework@ico.org.uk.

Please remember to quote the reference number above in your response.

Yours faithfully

Information Governance



Year

2011
2012
2013
2014
2015
2016
2017
2018
2019
2020
2021
2022
2023

No. determined
1678
1735
1794
2091
1956
1889
2072
2137
2003
1528
2044
2137
2159

No. appeals
30
31
38
46
41
35
68
58
67
46
31
51
71

No. Allowed
12
11
14
14

8
6
24
20
14
16
6
10
18

% applications that are

appealed

1.78784267
1.786743516
2.118171683
2.199904352
2.096114519
1.852832186
3.281853282
2.714085166
3.344982526
3.010471204
1.516634051
2.386523163
3.288559518

% Allowed

40
35.48387097
36.84210526
30.43478261
19.51219512
17.14285714
35.29411765
34.48275862
20.89552239
34.7826087
19.35483871
19.60784314
25.35211268



