
 

 

Information Governance Team 

Postal Address: 

Coventry City Council 

PO Box 7097 

Coventry 

CV6 9SL 

www.coventry.gov.uk 
E mail: infogov@coventry.gov.uk 
Phone: 024 7697 5408

10 July 2025 

Dear Sir/Madam 

Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA) 
Request ID: FOI726225442 

Thank you for your request for information relating to Buildings with ACM Cladding.

You have requested the following information:

I am writing under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to request the following information
regarding buildings within your local authority area: 

1. The total number of buildings that currently have Aluminium Composite Material (ACM)
cladding - the same type that significantly contributed to the Grenfell Tower fire. 

2. Of these: 

o How many are residential (e.g., flats or houses)? 
o How many exceed 18 metres in height? 
o How many have had funding approved for remediation? 
o How many have begun or completed remediation (please specify stages). 
3. If possible, please provide anonymised data or a list of affected buildings, categorised by
building type and ownership (e.g., council-owned, housing association, private leasehold). 

In response to your request, we confirm that we do not hold this information and are informing you
as per Section 1(1) of the Act. We do not record this information on our system. 

For information, we publish a variety of information such as:  FOI/EIR Disclosure Log,  Publication
Scheme,  Facts about Coventry and Open Data that you may find of useful if you are looking for
information in the future. 



If you are unhappy with the handling of your request, you can ask us to review our response.
Requests for reviews should be submitted within 40 days of the date of receipt of our response to
your original request – email:  infogov@coventry.gov.uk

If you are unhappy with the outcome of our review, you can write to the Information Commissioner,
who can be contacted at: Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane,
Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF or email  icocasework@ico.org.uk.

Please remember to quote the reference number above in your response.

Yours faithfully 
  
Information Governance 




