Information Governance Team

Postal Address:
Coventry City Council
PO Box 7097
Coventry

CV6 9SL

www.coventry.gov.uk

E mail: infogov@coventry.gov.uk
Phone: 024 7697 5408

31 July 2025
Dear Sir/Madam

Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA)
Request ID: FOI728312352

Thank you for your request for information relating to Adult learning disability services.
You have requested the following information:

1. Please could you supply the name, email address and telephone number of the
commissioner with responsibility for learning disabilities placements?

Paul McConnell

Joint Commissioning Manager

Email Paul.McConnell@coventry.gov.uk
Tel: 02476 977197

For questions 2 to 6, please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of the year for
the financial years 2024/25 and the most up to date snapshot available for 2025/26.

2. Please provide the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the Local
Authority in residential care.

2024-25 - 153 people
2025 26 151 people

3. Of the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the Local Authority in
residential care (q.2) please provide the number that are in 'in area' placements and the
number that are in 'out of area’' placements.



4. Please provide the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the Local
Authority in supported living.

2024-25 - 241 people
2025 26 240 people

5. Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who transitioned from
children's learning disabilities services into adult's services - into adult residential care

services only, into adult supported living services only, and in total.

In response to Question 5, we refer you to the following table.

Total number of adults with LD who have transitioned from 19
children’s LD services into adults’ LD services - during.
financial year 2024/2025
- Intoresidential care services 3
- Into supported living services 1

Total number of adults with LD who have transitioned from 3
children’s LD services into adults’ LD services - during.
financial year 2025/2026 (up until 21.07.2025)

- Intoresidential care services 0
- Into supported living services 0
Total number of children who still require transition into 10

adults’ LD services from children’s LD services during the
remainder of current financial year 2025/2026

*Total number of adults with LD who have transitioned from |3
children’s LD services into fully health-funded services, not
funded by CCC (added separately in case required, not
included in figures above)*

6. Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who 'stepped down' from
specialist inpatient hospital placements into adult residential care and supported living
services.

We do not hold this information and are advising you as per Section 1(1) of this Act.
7. Please provide the local authority's total expenditure on residential care and supported
living for adults with learning disabilities for the financial year 2024/25, and budgeted

expenditure for 2025/26.

With regards to our total expenditure on residential care and supported living placements for adults
with learning disabilities for 2024/25, the figures provided below are from our Adult Social Care



Finance Return (ASCFR), which is due to be published on the NHSE’s website in the upcoming
months:

Residential care £14.937m
Supported Living placements - £3.227m
Total £18.164m

With regards to our budgeted expenditure for 2025/26, we confirm we do not hold this information
and we are informing you as per Section 1(1) of the Act. We do not currently budget at the
necessary level to be able to provide this data. However, in order to fulfil our obligation as per
Section 16 of the FOIA to advise and assist, we can confirm that there is funding provided for
inflation, which includes the National Living Wage for 2025/26 within the Council budget.

8. Please provide the highest, lowest, and average weekly rate paid by the Local Authority
for residential care placements for adults with a learning disability for each of the financial
years 2024/25 and 2025/26. If the Local Authority has weekly rate bands, please also provide
these.

This data includes in city and out of city placements as at 18/07/25:

Highest - £6517.45
Lowest £603.14
Average - £2328.03

2024/25

Highest - £6174.75
Lowest £571.43
Average - £2212.14

9. Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the Local
Authority in residential care with fees per week of:

a. Less than £1,500 55
b. £1,500 to £2,999 - 60
c. £3,000 to £4,999 34
d. £5,000 or more - 6

The supply of information in response to a FOI/EIR request does not confer an automatic right to
re-use the information. You can use any information supplied for the purposes of private study and
non commercial research without requiring further permission. Similarly, information supplied can
also be re-used for the purposes of news reporting. An exception to this is photographs. Please
contact us if you wish to use the information for any other purpose.

For information, we publish a variety of information such as: FOI/EIR Disclosure Log, Publication
Scheme, Facts about Coventry and Open Data that you may find of useful if you are looking for
information in the future.

If you are unhappy with the handling of your request, you can ask us to review our response.
Requests for reviews should be submitted within 40 days of the date of receipt of our response to



your original request — email: infogov@coventry.gov.uk

If you are unhappy with the outcome of our review, you can write to the Information Commissioner,
who can be contacted at: Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane,
Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF or email icocasework@ico.org.uk.

Please remember to quote the reference number above in your response.

Yours faithfully

Information Governance





