
 

 

Information Governance Team 

Postal Address: 

Coventry City Council 

PO Box 7097 

Coventry 

CV6 9SL 

www.coventry.gov.uk 
E mail: infogov@coventry.gov.uk 
Phone: 024 7697 5408

26 September 2025 

Dear Sir/Madam 

Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA) 
Request ID: FOI744823640 

Thank you for your request for information relating to Young Carer Information and Services.

You have requested the following information:

1. How the council defines a young carer. 
The council uses the national definition of Young Carer as a person under the age of 18 who
provides or intends to provide care for another person such as relative or family friend due to
illness, disability, mental health issues, or substance misuse problems. 

2, The number of young carers who were referred to your services. 
We advise as per Section 1(1) of the Act that we do not hold information for years 2020/21 to
2022/23. 

 

3. The annual budgets in the financial years between 2020 and 2025 that were allocated to
supporting young carers. 

 



4. The criteria young carers must meet to receive support from the council 
Anyone providing care under the age of 18 who is providing care for someone else. 

5. Grants available to young carers, their purpose, and their monetary amount. We do not
provide specific grants to young carers at present. 
Needs Assessment and Transitional Support. 

6. The proportion of young carers referred to the council who had a needs assessment. 
We advise as per Section 1(1) of the Act that we do not hold information. We do not collate this
data. However this is the amount of young carers who have had an assessment by year. 

 

7. The percentage of young carers over 18 who received a transition assessment before they
turned 18. 
We advise as per Section 1(1) of the Act that we do not hold information. We do not collate this
data at present. 

Respite Support 

8. A list and details of any respite schemes for young carers, whether they are fully funded,
and who is responsible for fulfilling them. 
We do not commission any specific respite provision for young carers. We do have provision to
provide breaks both in adult services and children’s however do not collate the reasoning as to
whether it is young carer related. 

9. The number of young Carers receiving each type of respite support (A and B – as defined
below). 
As above. 

10. For those receiving respite support, please provide the number of days of respite each
young carer may receive on average per (Type A and B defined below). 

Respite type and other definitions 

A. Support that allows carers to take a break from caring, while the person they care for is
looked after by someone else. 
B. Trips, activities, workshops, therapeutic support or social opportunities that young
carers receive from the council. 

As above. 

The supply of information in response to a FOI/EIR request does not confer an automatic right to
re-use the information. You can use any information supplied for the purposes of private study and
non commercial research without requiring further permission. Similarly, information supplied can
also be re-used for the purposes of news reporting. An exception to this is photographs. Please



contact us if you wish to use the information for any other purpose. 

For information, we publish a variety of information such as:  FOI/EIR Disclosure Log,  Publication
Scheme,  Facts about Coventry and   Open Data that you may find of useful if you are looking for
information in the future. 

If you are unhappy with the handling of your request, you can ask us to review our response.
Requests for reviews should be submitted within 40 days of the date of receipt of our response to
your original request – email:  infogov@coventry.gov.uk

If you are unhappy with the outcome of our review, you can write to the Information Commissioner,
who can be contacted at: Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane,
Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF or email  icocasework@ico.org.uk.

Please remember to quote the reference number above in your response.

Yours faithfully 
  

Information Governance 




