Information Governance Team

Postal Address:
Coventry City Council
PO Box 7097
Coventry

CV6 9SL

www.coventry.gov.uk

E mail: infogov@coventry.gov.uk
Phone: 024 7697 5408

01 September 2025

Dear Sir/Madam

Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA)
Request ID: FOI743127929

Thank you for your request for information relating to Private Public charge point statistics - Public
Charge Point Regulations.

You have requested the following information:

1. How many public electric vehicle charge points does this council currently own or
operate?

This includes those managed through Charge Point Operators (CPOs). This can also
include privately-owned electric vehicle charge points that are open to the public during
certain hours or days, thereby necessitating compliance with Public Charge Point
Regulations.

We confirm that we do not hold information relating to privately owned electric vehicle charge
points that are open to the public during certain hours or days, thereby necessitating compliance
with Public Charge Point Regulations, and we are informing you as per Section 1(1) of the Act. We
do not record this information on our system.

The attached table lists all public EV chargers that Coventry City Council has been involved in
delivering, and for which it manages the ChargePoint infrastructure contract. However, it is
important to note that none of these chargers are owned or operated by the Council. Ownership
and operation remains with the respective Charge Point Operators for the duration of the contract.

2. Are all the public electric vehicle charge points in Question 1 compliant with the current
'Public Charge Point Regulations'? If not all, then how many are compliant?



Yes, we confirm that all public electric vehicle charge points in question are compliant with the
current 'Public Charge Point Regulations'.

3. What steps have been taken in the past year (August 2024 — present) by the council to
ensure compliance with the current 'Public Charge Point Regulations'?

The contract clauses asks the Charge Point Operators (CPOs) to make sure that the EV chargers
are always compliant with current regulations.

4. Has this council experienced any challenges in the past year (August 2024 — present)
when working to comply with the current 'Public Charge Point Regulations'?

From 24 November 2025, all public charge points must offer payment roaming according to
the Public Charge Point Regulations. This means that all public charge points must be
connected to at least one third-party roaming provider. Public charge points that are free to
use are not within the scope of this requirement.

No challenges were experienced by Coventry City Council when getting the charge point operators
to comply with the Public Charge Point Regulations.

5. Of your current number of public electric vehicle charge points in Question 1, how many
currently offer payment roaming services?

We confirm that all our charge points are connected to third-party roaming providers.

6. If not all of them, are plans in place (by yourself or your CPO) to connect them to a
roaming provider by November 2025?

Not applicable.

7. Of your current number of public electric vehicle charge points in Question 1, how many
of them are free to use? 'Free to use' means anyone can access them without restriction,
and no payment is required.

For reference, the current Public Charge Points Regulations (2023) are available here,
including information on the November 2025 payment roaming deadline -
https://www.gov.uk/government/publications/the-public-charge-point-regulations-2023-
guidance/public-charge-point-regulations-2023-guidance

None as they are all commercial charge points operated by Charge Point Operators.

The supply of information in response to a FOI request does not confer an automatic right to re-
use the information. You can use any information supplied for the purposes of private study and
non-commercial research without requiring further permission. Similarly, information supplied can
also be re used for the purposes of news reporting. An exception to this is photographs. Please
contact us if you wish to use the information for any other purpose.

For information, we publish a variety of information such as: FOI/EIR Disclosure Log, Publication
Scheme, Facts about Coventry and Open Data that you may find of useful if you are looking for
information in the future.

If you are unhappy with the handling of your request, you can ask us to review our response.
Requests for reviews should be submitted within 40 days of the date of receipt of our response to



your original request — email: infogov@coventry.gov.uk

If you are unhappy with the outcome of our review, you can write to the Information Commissioner,
who can be contacted at: Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane,
Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF or email icocasework@ico.org.uk.

Please remember to quote the reference number above in your response.

Yours faithfully

Information Governance





